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Item # Description Est. Qty  Unit Price Extended Price
001 Horizontal Air Meters - Repaired 13  $                               116.00  $                            1,508.00 
002 New Vertical Chamber Air Meter Units 17  $                               527.00  $                            8,959.00 
003 New Horizontal Chamber Air Meter Units 4  No Bid  No Bid 

TOTAL 10,467.00$                          

Item # Description Est. Qty  Unit Price Extended Price
001 Horizontal Air Meters - Repaired 13  $                               145.00  $                            1,885.00 
002 New Vertical Chamber Air Meter Units 17  $                               575.00  $                            9,775.00 
003 New Horizontal Chamber Air Meter Units 4  $                               575.00  $                            2,300.00 

TOTAL 13,960.00$                          

Item # Description Est. Qty  Unit Price Extended Price
001 Horizontal Air Meters - Repaired 13  $                               260.00  $                            3,380.00 
002 New Vertical Chamber Air Meter Units 17  $                               285.00  $                            4,845.00 
003 New Horizontal Chamber Air Meter Units 4  $                               285.00  $                            1,140.00 

TOTAL 9,365.00$                            
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Air Meters
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April 15, 2010 @ 2:00 p.m.

Item # Description Est. Qty  Unit Price Extended Price
001 Horizontal Air Meters - Repaired 13  No Bid  No Bid 
002 New Vertical Chamber Air Meter Units 17  $                               545.00  $                            9,265.00 
003 New Horizontal Chamber Air Meter Units 4  No Bid  No Bid 

TOTAL 9,265.00$                            

Apparent Low Bid
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