
RFB 2-100122BT - COLD WEATHER TRAFFIC MARKING PAINT

Item # Description & C/S Comm. Code Est. Qty. Vogel Traffic Services Sherwin-Williams Ennis Paint
Total Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

District 1
Totes Delivery

1 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 No Bid No Bid 8.64$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 
2 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 No Bid No Bid 9.23$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 

TOTAL -$                    -$                    -$                    

District 2
Totes Delivery

3 White Water Borne - 6306686890 18,000     6.82$                    122,760.00$         8.64$                     155,520.00$         7.536$                  135,648.00$         
4 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 18,000     6.63$                    119,340.00$         9.23$                     166,140.00$         7.988$                  143,784.00$         

TOTAL 242,100.00$        321,660.00$        279,432.00$        

District 3
Totes Delivery

5 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 No Bid No Bid 8.64$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 
6 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 No Bid No Bid 9.23$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 

TOTAL -$                    -$                    -$                    

District 4 - Kansas City
Totes Delivery

7 White Water Borne - 6306686890 1,000       6.82$                    6,820.00$             8.64$                     8,640.00$             7.568$                  7,568.00$             
8 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 1,000       6.63$                    6,630.00$             9.23$                     9,230.00$             8.02$                    8,020.00$             

SUB-TOTAL 13,450.00$            17,870.00$            15,588.00$            

District 4 - Warrensburg 
Totes Delivery

9 White Water Borne - 6306686890 1,000       6.82$                    6,820.00$             8.64$                     8,640.00$             7.536$                  7,536.00$             
10 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 1,000       6.63$                    6,630.00$             9.23$                     9,230.00$             7.988$                  7,988.00$             

SUB-TOTAL 13,450.00$            17,870.00$            15,524.00$            

TOTAL 26,900.00$          35,740.00$          31,112.00$          

District 5
Totes Delivery

11 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 No Bid No Bid 8.64$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 
12 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 No Bid No Bid 9.23$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 

TOTAL -$                    -$                    -$                    



District 6
Totes Delivery

13 White Water Borne - 6306686890 3,500       7.10$                    24,850.00$           8.64$                     30,240.00$           7.536$                  26,376.00$           
14 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 3,500       6.91$                    24,185.00$           9.23$                     32,305.00$           7.99$                    27,965.00$           

TOTAL 49,035.00$          62,545.00$          54,341.00$          

District 7
Totes Delivery

15 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 No Bid No Bid 8.64$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 
16 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 No Bid No Bid 9.23$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 

TOTAL -$                    -$                    -$                    

District 8
Totes Delivery

17 White Water Borne - 6306686890 5,000       7.10$                    35,500.00$           8.64$                     43,200.00$           7.59$                    37,950.00$           
18 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 5,000       6.91$                    34,550.00$           9.23$                     46,150.00$           8.05$                    40,250.00$           

TOTAL 70,050.00$          89,350.00$          78,200.00$          

District 9 - Willow Springs
Totes Delivery

19 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 No Bid No Bid 8.64$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 
20 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 No Bid No Bid 9.23$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 

SUB-TOTAL -$                       -$                       -$                       

District 9 - Rolla
Totes Delivery

21 White Water Borne - 6306686890 3,000       7.10$                    21,300.00$           8.64$                     25,920.00$           7.75$                    23,250.00$           
22 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 3,000       6.91$                    20,730.00$           9.23$                     27,690.00$           8.20$                    24,600.00$           

SUB-TOTAL 42,030.00$            53,610.00$            47,850.00$            

TOTAL 42,030.00$          53,610.00$          47,850.00$          

District 10 - Sikeston
Totes Delivery

23 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 No Bid No Bid 8.64$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 
24 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 No Bid No Bid 9.23$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 

SUB-TOTAL -$                       -$                       -$                       

District 10 - Park Hills
Totes Delivery

25 White Water Borne - 6306686890 0 No Bid No Bid 8.64$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 
26 Yellow Water Borne - 6306686950 0 No Bid No Bid 9.23$                     -$                      No Bid No Bid 

SUB-TOTAL -$                       -$                       -$                       
TOTAL -$                    -$                    -$                    



GRAND TOTAL FOR ALL DISTRICTS 430,115.00$         562,905.00$         490,935.00$         


	Tabulation

