Bid Tabulations/ Posted Date 3/28/11

Time: 4:00 P.M.

BID TABULATIONS

D7-11-035

Chip Seal Rental Equipment

VENDOR

Description of Service

QTY

QTY

Price Per Month

(units) (months)

Extended Costs

Rental Period

Date Available

Victor L. Phillips Self Propel Brooms NO BID ON BROOMS NO BID
Bill Ewan 0 2 $0.00 $0.00 July 1, 2011 - Sept 1, 2011
Dynapac; CP142 Pneumatic Rollers 3 2 $2,795.00 $5,590.00 July 1, 2011 - Sept 1, 2011 7/1/2011, Subject to Availability.
3 2 $2,795.00 $5,590.00 7/1/2011, Subject to Availability.
3 2 $2,795.00 $5,590.00 7/1/2011, Subject to Availability.
TOTAL $16,770.00
Van Keppel Self Propel Brooms Shipping included
David Bolerjack Variable Speed Model 2 2 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 July 1, 2011 - Sept 1, 2011 1-Jul
Rotary RJ530 Standard-Non Variable Speed NO BID NO BID NO BID
Same as last year's equipment
Hypac C530A Pneumatic Rollers
3 2 $2,275.00 $13,650.00 July 1, 2011 - Sept 1, 2011 1-Jul
TOTAL $19,650.00
Midwest Equipment Co Self Propel Brooms NO BID
Jerry Freitag Variable Speed Model 0 2 NO BID NO BID July 1, 2011 - Sept 1, 2011
Standard-Non Variable Speed
NO BID NO BID
Pneumatic Rollers 0 2
TOTAL NO BID
Murphy Tractor Self Propel Brooms 2 2 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 July 1, 2011 - Sept 1, 2011 Send on Friday for Monday
Daniel Dooley Delivery
Variable Speed - DT80J Model
Pneumatic Rollers 3 2 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL $8,000.00
Fabick CAT Self Propel Brooms 0 2 NO BID NO BID July 1, 2011 - Sept 1, 2011 NO BID
Mike Cantrell
Pneumatic Rollers 0 2 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL NO BID
Grand Total of Bid TOTAL $44,420.00




