Paints, Brushes & Thinners

Bid Request #1-070322

22-Mar-07
e a ationa O e e e PP O
ITEM: DESCRIPTION: EST QTY: UNIT UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

Mineral Spirits - 5 Gallon Metal Container, With

1 Handle and Pouring Spout 350 GAL $ 452 (% 1,582.00 | $ 499 | $ 1,746.50 No Bid No Bid

2 Lacquer Thinner, 1-Gallon Container 180 GAL $ 6.69 [ $ 1,204.20 | $ 6.95 [ $ 1,251.00 No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 1 - awarded all or none OTA $ 2,786.20 [EOANA 2,997.50 [EOANA $ -
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

3 Fluorescent Pink 9,600 CAN $ 206 | $ 19,776.00 | $ 3181 % 30,528.00 | $ 195($% 18,720.00
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

4 Fluorescent Orange 3600 CAN $ 206 | $ 7,416.00 | $ 3181 % 11,448.00 | $ 195 (% 7,020.00

5 Paint, Marking, Aerosol, WHITE 4800 CAN $ 206 | $ 9,888.00 | $ 318 | $ 15,264.00 | $ 195 (% 9,360.00
CATEGORY 2 - awarded all or none OTA $ 37,080.00 OTA $ 57,240.00 OTA $ 35,100.00

6 Paint, Spray (aerosol), BLACK 1440 CAN $ 279 (% 4,017.60 | $ 138 |$ 1,987.20 | $ 165|$%$ 2,376.00

7 Paint, BLACK 1-gallon 96 GAL $ 1349 1% 1,295.04 | $ 21.84 | $ 2,096.64 | $ 2192 | $ 2,104.32

8 Primer, Metal Red Color 200 GAL $ 1525 | $ 3,050.00 $ = $ 2536 [ $ 5,072.00
Items 6, 7 & 8 awarded item by item OTA $ 8,362.64 OTA $ 4,083.84 OTA $ 9,552.32
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

9 Bristle; 1" size. 180 Each $0.00( $ 125($% 225.00 No Bid No Bid
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

10 |Bristle; 2" size 720 Each $0.00| $ 185 9% 1,332.00 No Bid No Bid
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

11 |Bristle; 4" size. 720 Each $0.00( $ 535| % 3,852.00 No Bid No Bid

CATEGORY 3 - awarded all or none

TOTAL

$0.00 [Eeay:\s $
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5,409.00 [uEGRPAR $
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ITEM: DESCRIPTION: EST QTY: UNIT UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

Mineral Spirits - 5 Gallon Metal Container, With

1 Handle and Pouring Spout 350 GAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Lacquer Thinner, 1-Gallon Container 180 GAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 1 - awarded all or none $ - $ - -
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

3 Fluorescent Pink 9,600 CAN No Bid No Bid $ 195 ( $ 18,720.00 No Bid No Bid
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

4 Fluorescent Orange 3600 CAN No Bid No Bid $ 195 (% 7,020.00 No Bid No Bid

5 Paint, Marking, Aerosol, WHITE 4800 CAN No Bid No Bid $ 195 | $ 9,360.00 No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 2 - awarded all or none $ - OTA $ 35,100.00 OTA -

6 Paint, Spray (aerosol), BLACK 1440 CAN No Bid No Bid $ 145 | $ 2,088.00 No Bid No Bid

7 Paint, BLACK 1-gallon 96 GAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Primer, Metal Red Color 200 GAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Items 6, 7 & 8 awarded by item TOTAL $ - OTA $ 2,088.00 [myeay: -
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

9 Bristle; 1" size. 180 Each $ 1.00 $180.00| $ 097 | % 174.60 | $ 1.15 207.00
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

10 |Bristle; 2" size 720 Each $ 2.15 $1,548.00( $ 140 (| $ 1,008.00 | $ 1.65 1,188.00
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

11  |Bristle; 4" size. 720 Each $ 4.75 $3,420.00| $ 393 |% 2,829.60 | $ 4.60 3,312.00
CATEGORY 3 - awarded all or none $5,148.00 Ao\l $ 4,012.20 $ 4,707.00
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ITEM: DESCRIPTION: EST QTY: UNIT UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

Mineral Spirits - 5 Gallon Metal Container, With

1 Handle and Pouring Spout 350 GAL $ 10.00 | $ 3,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Lacquer Thinner, 1-Gallon Container 180 GAL $ 832 |$% 1,497.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 1 - awarded all or none OTA $ 4,997.60 [RESIE: $ - $ -
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

3 Fluorescent Pink 9,600 CAN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

4 Fluorescent Orange 3600 CAN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Paint, Marking, Aerosol, WHITE 4800 CAN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 2 - awarded all or none TOTAL $ - TOTAL $ - TOTAL $ -

6 Paint, Spray (aerosol), BLACK 1440 CAN $ 3.00 (9% 4,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Paint, BLACK 1-gallon 96 GAL $ 36.00 | $ 3,456.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Primer, Metal Red Color 200 GAL $ 3085 | $ 6,170.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
[tems 6, 7 & 8 awarded by iitem T 3 B
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

9 Bristle; 1" size. 180 Each No Bid No Bid $ 132 (9% 237.60 | $ 111 ($ 199.80
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

10 |Bristle; 2" size 720 Each No Bid No Bid $ 236 | $ 1,699.20 | $ 161|$% 1,159.20
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

11  |Bristle; 4" size. 720 Each No Bid No Bid $ 316 | $ 2,275.20 | $ 452 | $ 3,254.40
CATEGORY 3 - awarded all or none TOTAL $0.00 [ger\\s $ 4,212.00 [uyeay\s $ 4,613.40

Prepared by Dee Pardue 4/19/2007

Page 3




ITEM: DESCRIPTION: EST QTY: UNIT UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

Mineral Spirits - 5 Gallon Metal Container, With

1 Handle and Pouring Spout 350 GAL $ 556 | $ 1,946.00 | $ 9981 % 3,493.00 | $ 519 | $ 1,816.50

2 Lacquer Thinner, 1-Gallon Container 180 GAL $ 7.40 | $ 1,332.00 | $ 1037 | $ 1,866.60 | $ 8321 $% 1,497.60
CATEGORY 1 - awarded all or none OTA $ 3,278.00 OTA $ 5,359.60 OTA $ 3,314.10
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

3 Fluorescent Pink 9,600 CAN $ 273 1% 26,208.00 | $ 350 | % 33,600.00 | $ 333|% 31,968.00
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

4 Fluorescent Orange 3600 CAN $ 273 1% 9,828.00 | $ 350 | % 12,600.00 | $ 333|% 11,988.00

5 Paint, Marking, Aerosol, WHITE 4800 CAN $ 273 ($ 13,104.00 | $ 350 1| $ 16,800.00 | $ 333 $% 15,984.00
CATEGORY 2 - awarded all or none OTA $ 49,140.00 OTA $ 63,000.00 OTA $ 59,940.00

6 Paint, Spray (aerosol), BLACK 1440 CAN $ 202 | $ 2,908.80 | $ 192 ($ 2,764.80 | $ 2231 % 3,211.20

7 Paint, BLACK 1-gallon 96 GAL $ 22721 $ 2,181.12 | $ 33.04($ 317184 | $ 1381 | $ 1,325.76

8 Primer, Metal Red Color 200 GAL $ 2272 | $ 4,544.00 | $ 15.02 | $ 3,004.00 | $ 1469 | $ 2,938.00
Items 6, 7 & 8 awarded by item OTA $ 9,633.92 OTA $ 8,940.64 OTA $ 7,474.96
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

9 Bristle; 1" size. 180 Each $ 1.12 $201.60| $ 144 | $ 250.20 | $ 119 ($ 214.20
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

10 |Bristle; 2" size 720 Each $ 1.63 $1,173.60| $ 209 | $ 1,504.80 | $ 177 | $ 1,274.40
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

11  |Bristle; 4" size. 720 Each $ 4.57 $3,290.40| $ 586 | $ 4,219.20 | $ 507 | $ 3,650.40
CATEGORY 3 - awarded all or none TOTAL $4,665.60 [uIOIV\% $ 5,983.20 HICIVAYN $ 5,139.00
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ITEM: DESCRIPTION: EST QTY: UNIT UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

Mineral Spirits - 5 Gallon Metal Container, With

1 Handle and Pouring Spout 350 GAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6.08 | $ 2,128.00

2 Lacquer Thinner, 1-Gallon Container 180 GAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 9.05 (% 1,629.00
CATEGORY 1 - awarded all or none $ - $ — W
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

3 Fluorescent Pink 9,600 CAN $ 3.06 | $ 29,376.00 No Bid No Bid $ 195 % 18,720.00
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

4 Fluorescent Orange 3600 CAN $ 291 (% 10,476.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1.95($ 7,020.00

5 Paint, Marking, Aerosol, WHITE 4800 CAN $ 291 (% 13,968.00 No Bid No Bid $ 195 (% 9,360.00
CATEGORY 2 - awarded all or none OTA $ 53,820.00 mEeIpA $ - OTA $ 35,100.00

6 Paint, Spray (aerosol), BLACK 1440 CAN $ 270 [ $ 3,888.00 No Bid No Bid $ 117 | $ 1,684.80

7 Paint, BLACK 1-gallon 96 GAL $ 2950 | $ 2,832.00 | $ 1299 | $ 1,247.04 | $ 16.95 | $ 1,627.20

8 Primer, Metal Red Color 200 GAL $ 3333 ($ 6,666.00 | $ 9.90 | $ 1,980.00 | $ 1313 | $ 2,626.00
Items 6, 7 & 8 awarded by item OTA $ 13,386.00 OTA $ 3,227.04 OTA $ 5,938.00
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

9 Bristle; 1" size. 180 Each $ 1.02 $183.60 No Bid No Bid $ 173 | $ 311.40
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

10 |Bristle; 2" size 720 Each $ 1.61 $1,159.20 No Bid No Bid $ 3.06 | $ 2,203.20
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

11  |Bristle; 4" size. 720 Each $ 4.01 $2,887.20 No Bid No Bid 9.27 | $ 6,674.40
CATEGORY 3 - awarded all or none $4,230.00 |RESIEAR $ Bl ToTAL $ 9,189.00
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ITEM: DESCRIPTION: EST QTY: UNIT UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:

Mineral Spirits - 5 Gallon Metal Container, With

1 Handle and Pouring Spout 350 GAL $ 719 | $ 2,516.50 No Bid No Bid $ -

2 Lacquer Thinner, 1-Gallon Container 180 GAL $ 819 (% 1,474.20 No Bid No Bid $ -
CATEGORY 1 - awarded all or none OTA $ 3,990.70 [mIeIrA $ - W
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

3 Fluorescent Pink 9,600 CAN $ 205 | $ 19,680.00 | $ 195($%$ 18,720.00 $ -
Paint, Marking, Aerosol,

4 Fluorescent Orange 3600 CAN $ 205 | $ 7,380.00 | $ 195($%$ 7,020.00 $ -

5 Paint, Marking, Aerosol, WHITE 4800 CAN $ 205 (% 9,840.00 | $ 195($ 9,360.00 $ -
CATEGORY 2 - awarded all or none OTA $ 36,900.00 uEeRpA $ 35,100.00 pugeRpA $ -

6 Paint, Spray (aerosol), BLACK 1440 CAN $ 250 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 140 ($ 2,016.00 $ -

7 Paint, BLACK 1-gallon 96 GAL $ 21.90 | $ 2,102.40 | $ 1363 | $ 1,308.48 $ -

8 Primer, Metal Red Color 200 GAL $ 2219 | $ 4,438.00 | $ 995 $ 1,990.00 $ -
Items 6, 7 & 8 awarded by item OTA $ 10,140.40 myexy: $ 5,314.48 mie1y: $ -
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

9 Bristle; 1" size. 180 Each $ 1.69 $304.20| $ 1.09 | $ 196.20 $ -
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

10 |Bristle; 2" size 720 Each $ 2.19 $1,576.80| $ 158 | $ 1,137.60 $ -
Brush, paint, for all paints (latex or oil), 100% China

11  |Bristle; 4" size. 720 Each $ 5.59 $4,024.80| $ 441 | $ 3,175.20 $ -

CATEGORY 3 - awarded all or none

TOTAL

Did not bid as specified

Award Recommendations:

Sherwin-Williams: Category 1 (items 1 & 2): low bidder - bidding as specified

$5,905.80 [uEoay:\8 $

4,509.00 EOV:\R $

Davis Paint Co.: Item #7 low bidder - bidding as specified; item #8 - award under review as of 4/18/2007- 2nd low bidder: low bidder did not bid as specified - Davis Paint product

Diamond Vogel: Category #2: 4-way tie; per 7 CSR 10-11.020.14, contract to be awarded to a
bidder doing business as a Missouri firm. Lots were drawn for Missouri vendors GM Supply, McGregor Hardware and Diamond Vogel. Diamond Vogel won the drawing for award of category #2.

Black & Co.: Item #6; low bidder - bidding as specified

McGregor Hardware: Category 3 (items 9, 10 & 11); 2nd low bidder - bidding as specified. Low bidder did not bid as specified.
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