Photo Lab Supplies Summary

IFB 1-070605
Photograp & Digita aging
er & Co PP
ITEM: DESCRIPTION: EST QTY: UNIT COST: EXT COST: UNIT COST: EXT COST:
Kodak Color Pro 400
1 |#165-8830 20| $ 3811% 76.20 $ o
Kodak Color Pro 400
2 |#181-9903 100| $ 762 (% 762.00 $ o
Kodak Color Pro 400
3 |#881-5011 20| $ 3641 % 72.80 $ o
4 |Pakon Sleeving 1$ 25.00 | $ 25.00 $ -
5 |CPAC Master 6| $ 23.19 | $ 139.14 $ =
$ 1,075.14 [NV $ -
6 [Sony DZM 200 $ 2911 $ 582.00 no bid #VALUE!
7 |Fuji #FUJBT30 150( $ 141 1% 211.50 no bid #VALUE!
8 |[Fuji #FUIBT60 150| $ 1.76 [ $ 264.00 no bid #VALUE!
9 |Fuji #FUJBT10 150( $ 122 1% 183.00 no bid #VALUE!
10 |Video Tape Sleeve 350 $ 0.26 | $ 91.00 no bid #VALUE!
$ 1,33150 |UCRIOWANA]  #VALUE!
11 |[Epson - Lustre 44" 6| $ 176.00 | $ 1,056.00 | $ 190.85 [ $ 1,145.10
12 |Epson - Gloss 44" 6| $ 232.80 | $ 1,396.80 | $ 190.85 | $ 1,145.10
13 [Epson - Hmatte 44" 4[ $ 81.60 | $ 326.40 | $ 80.50 | $ 322.00
14 |Epson - Lustre 24" 6| $ 11040 | $ 662.40 | $ 110.00 | $ 660.00
15 |Epson - Glossy 24" 6| $ 11040 | $ 662.40 | $ 110.00 | $ 660.00
16 |Epson Hmatte 24" 4/ $ 41.00 [ $ 164.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 188.00
17 |Epson - Lustre 8.5 4{ $ 22871 % 9148 | $ 24151 $ 96.60
18 |Epsom - Lustre 13x19 4[ $ 76.63 [ $ 306.52 | $ 90.29 | $ 361.16
19 |Epson 7600 ink 10( $ 86.52 | $ 865.20 | $ 93.50 | $ 935.00
20 |Epson 9500 ink 10 $ 88.80 | $ 888.00 | $ 9755 | $ 975.50
$ ECRN] SUB TOTAL #3 B 6,488.46
21 |Kodak T-Max 4[ $ 45.61 [ $ 182.44 no bid #VALUE!
22 |Kodak Developer 6| $ 8.05|$% 48.30 no bid #VALUE!
23 |25 Micron 30| $ 1.62 (% 48.60 no bid #VALUE!
24 |Kodak Tmax 4"x5" 2| $ 41.36 | $ 82.72 no bid #VALUE!
25 |Kodak Tmax 35 mm 10| $ 430 | $ 43.00 no bid #VALUE!
26 |llford Multigrade 5"x7" 2| $ 3181 | $ 63.62 no bid #VALUE!
IIford Multigrade
27 [8"x10" 10( $ 75.86 | $ 758.60 no bid #VALUE!
IIford Multigrade
28 |[Paper Developer 4[ $ 36.97 | $ 147.88 no bid #VALUE!
29 |liford Rapid Fixer 4 $ 3115 [ $ 124.60 no bid #VALUE!
30 |Heico Perma Wash 119 21.65| $ 21.65 no bid #VALUE!
$ 152141 SRl #VALUE!
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31 |Konica Control Strips 11] $ 50.60 [ $ 556.60 | $ 55.20 | $ 607.20
32 |Ecojet-N Cartridges 3 $ 173.38 | $ 520.14 | $ 165.20 | $ 495.60
33 |Konica #52N-1S 2| $ 9.60 | $ 19.20 [ $ 8.10 | $ 16.20
34 |Konica #52N-25 2| $ 1840 | $ 36.80 | $ 1428 | $ 28.56
35 |Konica Deve #52N-1 2| $ 73.33 | $ 146.66 | $ 68.05 | $ 136.10
36 |Konica #52N-2 2| $ 91.54 [ $ 183.08 | $ 85.43 | $ 170.86
37 |Konica Fixer #52N-3 2| $ 31.22 | $ 62.44 | $ 28.56 | $ 57.12
38 |Konica Stab #52N-4 2|$ 55.14 [ $ 110.28 | $ 44.20 [ $ 88.40
Nice Print System
39 |Filters 4[ $ 83.79 [ $ 335.16 | $ 84.00 | $ 336.00
Nice Print System
40 |Cleaning Agent 2| $ 2196 | $ 4392 | $ 1760 | $ 35.20
41 |Ecojet Paper Cart. 6| $ 367.78 | $ 2,206.68 | $ 367.75 | $ 2,206.50
Vendor priced 2
rolls/box for 20
Konica QA Matte total rolls =
42 [#AA51027 10( $ 48.77 | $ 487.70 | $ 46.98 | $ 469.80 |$46.98 per roll
Vendor priced 2
rolls/box for 40
Konica QA Matte total rolls =
43 [#AA50559 20| $ 52.31 [ $ 1,046.20 | $ 50.44 | $ 1,008.80 |$50.44 per roll
44 |Konica Filters 4[ $ 7749 [ $ 309.96 | $ 84.00 [ $ 336.00
Konica Backside
45 |Printer Ribbon 2 43.24 $ 17.14
SUB TOTAL #5 CRINE SUB TOTAL #5 I3 6,009.48

TOTAL ALL
CATEGORIES:

Non-Responsive: Did not bid all items in the category
Total is different than what is shown on vendor's bid

AWARD RECOMMENDATIONS: (Note: Award is by category)

W. Schiller & Co.: Award Categories 1, 2, 3, and 4 as the low, responsive bidder
Photographic & Digial Imaging: Award Category 5 as the low, responsive bidder

16,455.31

TOTAL ALL
CATEGORIES:
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$ 12,497.94

Vendor did not bid
all categories
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