
ITEM DESCRIPTION: C/D
EST 
QTY:

UNIT 
COST: EXT COST:

UNIT 
COST: EXT COST:

1 JC Mono Blade, 6' 0221566065 85 12.45$   1,058.25$         - No Bid 
2 Bolt Kit 0221566085 55 6.10$     335.50$            - No Bid 
3 Gearbox, 6' 0221566170 5 215.00$ 1,075.00$         - No Bid 
4 Trail wheel assembly 0221566345 20 89.00$   1,780.00$         63.48$      1,269.60$         
5 Shaft with clutch 0221570452 15 263.00$ 3,945.00$         - No Bid 
6 Section, under-serrated 0221591738 5 13.90$   69.50$              7.51$        37.55$              
7 Section, over-serrated 0221570515 145 18.95$   2,747.75$         319.75$    46,363.75$       
8 Center guard position 0221570600 745 8.95$     6,667.75$         9.40$        7,003.00$         
9 Inner guard left position 0221570607 60 9.25$     555.00$            7.88$        472.80$            

10 Outer guard right position 0221570612 60 9.25$     555.00$            7.88$        472.80$            
11 Flanged lock nut 0221570672 225 1.17$     263.25$            0.41$        92.25$              

12
Sickle knife, under - 
serrated 6' 0221570715 5 44.50$   222.50$            39.53$      197.65$            

13
Sickle knife, over- 
serrated 6' 0221570720 45 55.00$   2,475.00$         95.90$      4,315.50$         

14 Cutterbar, 6' 0221570750 10 160.00$ 1,600.00$         205.88$    2,058.80$         
15 Clip, low spring 0221570810 315 8.00$     2,520.00$         1.66$        522.90$            
16 Clip, high spring 0221570815 70 8.85$     619.50$            2.43$        170.10$            
17 Wear plate 6' 0221570905 75 8.95$     671.25$            2.49$        186.75$            
18 Wear strip 0221570925 10 5.95$     59.50$              - No Bid 
19 Pitman assembly 0221591525 15 107.00$ 1,605.00$         127.60$    1,914.00$         
20 Knife heap cap, rear 0221591130 25 2.00$     50.00$              2.85$        71.25$              
21 Carriage 0221591140 10 349.00$ 3,490.00$         366.38$    3,663.80$         
22 Pitman connector 0221591147 50 2.25$     112.50$            1.14$        57.00$              
23 Cylinder, curb stop 0221591155 10 225.00$ 2,250.00$         219.06$    2,190.60$         
24 Cylinder, lift bar 0221591158 10 215.00$ 2,150.00$         179.81$    1,798.10$         
25 Side outlet elbow 0221591180 45 3.75$     168.75$            5.16$        232.20$            
26 Fly wheel assembly 0221591200 5 78.00$   390.00$            77.64$      388.20$            
27 Motor guard 0221591247 5 144.00$ 720.00$            145.03$    725.15$            
28 Knife head cap, front 0221591258 5 7.46$     37.30$              12.74$      63.70$              
29 Knuckle 0221591445 5 135.00$ 675.00$            89.84$      449.20$            
30 Motor mount 0221591465 5 179.00$ 895.00$            258.99$    1,294.95$         
31 Motor mount support 0221591470 5 165.00$ 825.00$            162.45$    812.25$            
32 Pin, release 0221591530 25 20.78$   519.50$            24.30$      607.50$            
33 Pin, clevis 0221591553 30 3.10$     93.00$              1.85$        55.50$              
34 Pin, carriage 0221591555 30 12.99$   389.70$            11.56$      346.80$            
35 Pin, rocker 0221591556 20 6.35$     127.00$            3.50$        70.00$              
36 Plate, knife wear, rear 0221591562 35 2.60$     91.00$              2.49$        87.15$              
37 Shim, knife head cap 0221591743 50 0.99$     49.50$              1.05$        52.50$              
38 Sole, innter shoe 0221591765 25 21.25$   531.25$            43.73$      1,093.25$         
39 Sole, outer shoe 0221591770 20 12.50$   250.00$            11.85$      237.00$            
40 Subframe 0221591779 5 344.00$ 1,720.00$         340.48$    1,702.40$         
41 Support, cutterbar 0221591790 10 265.00$ 2,650.00$         308.48$    3,084.80$         

42
Support, spring with 
spring 0221591795 20 320.00$ 6,400.00$         357.82$    7,156.40$         

43 JC stump jumper 0221566070 5 225.00$ 1,125.00$         - No Bid 
44 JC drive shaft 0221566155 5 275.00$ 1,375.00$         - No Bid 
45 JC torque limiter 0221566360 10 89.15$   891.50$            - No Bid 
46 JC spider 0221566337 5 40.79$   203.95$            - No Bid 
47 Shoe assembly, inner 0221591015 15 85.00$   1,275.00$         98.84$      1,482.60$         
48 Shoe assembly, outer 0221591016 40 33.25$   1,330.00$         20.25$      810.00$            
49 Bolt, knuckle 0221591025 30 55.18$   1,655.40$         28.43$      852.90$            
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Hall Manufacturing Alamo Sales 

50

Hydraulic Motor-fits 
Triumph 2500 
HydroClipper-Moore 0221591460 25 295.00$ 7,375.00$         268.30$    6,707.50$         

51

Hydraulic Motor-fits 
Triumph 2500 
HydroClipper-Hall TBD 10 295.00$  2,950.00$          268.30$    2,683.00$          

TOTAL: 71,590.10$       TOTAL: 103,853.15$      

NOTE:  Items will be awarded on an "ITEM-BY-ITEM" basis.

NOTE: Did not bid to 
specifications

Award Recommendations: Award below listed items to the low, responsive bidder noted

Hall Manufacturing
Items: 1-3,5-8,12-16,18-21.25,27-28,30,32,37-38,41-47

Alamo Sales 
Items: 4,9,10-11,17,22-24,26,29,31,33-36,39-40,48,49-51
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