MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

~1 oSCo>T DISTRICT 10

6-061011 BID TABULATION - FUEL DELIVERY

DON HEIL OIL CO. **SANTIE OIL*** MFA
ZONE ITEM # FUEL TYPE MARGIN EVALUATION#| MARGIN EVALUATION#| MARGIN EVALUATION #
a B20 - Summer
Diesel| $0.3155 $0.3000
B100 -$0.0660 -$0.7000
NORTHERN B20 - Winter NON RESPONSIVE
Diesel| $0.3155 $0.3000
B100 -$0.6600 120.40 -$0.6500 104.17
b Unleaded $0.3010 0.3010 $0.3000 0.3000
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.2900
B100 -$0.6500
SOUTHERN B20 - Winter NO BID NON RESPONSIVE
Diesel $0.2900
B100 -$0.6200 104.50
b Unleaded NO BID $0.2900 0.2900
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3350
B100 -$0.6550
WESTERN B20 - Winter NO BID NON RESPONSIVE
Diesel $0.3350
B100 -$0.6400 138.25
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3325 0.3325
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3550
B100 -$0.6450
B20 - Winter NO BID NON RESPONSIVE
EASTERN Diesel $0.3550
B100 -$0.6450 155.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3550 0.3550
Transport $0.2230
BOLD | Indicates low bid per item

SANTIE OIL BID ON A DRAFT FORM OF BID - RESULT IN DISQUALIFICATION



