
ZONE ITEM # FUEL TYPE MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION #

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.3120
B100 -$0.6880

B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3120
B100 -$0.6880 112.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.3120 0.3120
Transport

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2680 $0.3820
B100 -$0.7310 -$0.6180

B20 - Winter
Diesel $0.2680 $0.3820
B100 -$0.6860 71.95 -$0.6180 182.00

b Unleaded $0.2680 $0.2680 $0.3770 0.3770

c E85 NO BID
Unleaded $0.2680

Ethanol -$0.2180 -145.10

a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3870
B100 -$0.6130

B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3870
B100 -$0.6130 187.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.3820 0.3820

a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3720
B100 -$0.6280

B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3720
B100 -$0.6280 172.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.3680 0.3680

BOLD     Indicates low bid per item
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