
ZONE ITEM # FUEL TYPE MARGIN
EVALUATION 

# MARGIN
EVALUATION 

# MARGIN
EVALUATION 

#

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2890 $0.3300
B100 -$0.5710 -$0.6700

B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3290 $0.3300
B100 -$0.5710 130.33 -$0.6700 130.00

b Unleaded $0.3290 0.3290 NO BID $0.3300 0.3300

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2590 $0.2900
B100 -$0.6010 -$0.7100

B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.2990 $0.2900
B100 -$0.6010 100.33 -$0.7100 90.00

b Unleaded $0.3090 0.3090 NO BID $0.2900 0.2900

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2690 $0.2900
B100 -$0.5910 -$0.7100

B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3090 $0.2900
B100 -$0.5910 110.33 -$0.7100 90.00

b Unleaded $0.3090 0.3090 NO BID $0.2900 0.2900

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2490 $0.3649 $0.3455
B100 -$0.6110 -$0.6351 -$0.6545

B20 - Winter
Diesel $0.2890 $0.3849 $0.3455
B100 -$0.6110 90.33 -$0.6151 173.23 -$0.6545 145.50

b Unleaded $0.2090 0.2090 $0.3649 0.3649 $0.3355 0.3355
Transport $0.2050 $0.2249 $0.2500

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2690 $0.3649 $0.2900
B100 -$0.5910 -$0.6351 -$0.7100

B20 - Winter
Diesel $0.3090 $0.3849 $0.2900
B100 -$0.5910 110.33 -$0.6151 173.23 -$0.7100 90.00

b Unleaded $0.2890 0.2890 $0.3649 0.3649 $0.2900 0.2900

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2890 $0.3050
B100 -$0.5710 -$0.6950

B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3290 $0.3050
B100 -$0.5710 130.33 -$0.6950 105.00

b Unleaded $0.3290 0.3290 NO BID $0.3050 0.3050

BOLD     Indicates low bid per item
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