
ZONE ITEM # FUEL TYPE MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION #

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2149 $0.2455 $0.3450
B100 -$0.7651 -$0.6950 -$0.6550

B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.2349 $0.2755 $0.3450
B100 -$0.7451 27.23 -$0.5250 81.57 -$0.6550 145.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.2049 0.2049 NO BID NO BID $0.2455 $0.3450
Transport 0.1849 $0.2450

c E85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unleaded $0.2949 $0.2655 $0.3450

Ethanol -$0.1951 -121.6000 -$0.2455 -168.8500 $0.1900 213.2500

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2490 $0.2349 $0.2755 $0.3350
B100 -$0.6110 -$0.7451 -$0.6650 -$0.6650

B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.2890 $0.2549 $0.3055 $0.3350
B100 -$0.6110 90.33 -$0.7251 47.23 -$0.4950 111.57 -0.67 135.00

b Unleaded $0.2490 0.2490 $0.2249 0.2249 NO BID NO BID $0.2455 0.2455 0.33 0.3250

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2890 $0.2349 $0.2455 $0.3350
B100 -$0.5710 -$0.7451 -$0.6950 -$0.6650

B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.3290 $0.2549 $0.2755 $0.3350
B100 -$0.5710 130.33 -$0.7251 47.23 -$0.5250 81.57 -$0.6650 135.00

b Unleaded $0.2690 0.2690 $0.2249 0.2249 NO BID NO BID $0.2455 0.2455 $0.3350 0.3350

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2649 $0.3400
B100 -$0.7151 -$0.6650 139.00

B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.2849 $0.3400
B100 -$0.6951 32.18 -$0.6650 139.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.2749 0.2749 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.3400 0.3400

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2449 $0.3350
B100 -$0.7351 -$0.6650

B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.2649 $0.3350
B100 -$0.7151 57.23 -$0.6650 135.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.3149 0.3149 NO BID $0.2979 0.2979 NO BID $0.3350 0.3350
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a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2449 $0.3350
B100 -$0.7351 -$0.6650

B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.2649 $0.3350
B100 -$0.7151 57.23 -$0.6650 135.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.3149 0.3149 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.3350 0.3350

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2449 $0.3175 $0.3450
B100 -$0.7351 -$0.6445 -$0.6550

B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.2649 $0.3175 $0.3450
B100 -$0.7151 57.23 -$0.6345 125.93 -$0.6550 145.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.3149 0.3149 $0.3225 0.3225 NO BID NO BID $0.3450 0.3450

a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.2449 $0.3350
B100 -$0.7351 -$0.6650

B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.2649 $0.3350
B100 -$0.7151 57.23 -$0.6650 135.00

b Unleaded NO BID $0.3149 0.3149 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.3350 $0.3350
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