MO T

MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DISTRICT 6
6-061011 BID TABULATION - FUEL DELIVERY

UNNERSTALL OIL THE KIESEL COMPANY ENERGY PETROLEUM Nu-WAY PETROLEUM QUICK FUEL MFA OIL COMPANY
ZONE | ITEM # | FUEL TYPE MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION #
a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.3267 $0.0690 $0.0500 $0.1100
B100 -$0.6208 -$0.7250 $0.0500 $0.1100
NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.3767 $0.0690 $0.0700 $0.1310
ST. LOUIS B100 -$0.6208 153.87 -$0.5500 -75.22 $0.0700 53.47 $0.1310 117.00
’ NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
b Unleaded NO BID $0.2167 0.2167 $0.0915 0.0915 NO BID $0.1100 0.1100
Transport $0.2167 $0.0020
c E85 NO BID NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
Unleaded $0.1495 $0.1500 NO BID
REBID
Ethanol $0.3500 319.93 $0.1500 150.00
a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.0990 $0.1000
JEFFERSON B100 -$0.7250 $0.1000
(Needs Rebid) NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
. B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Diesel and Diesel $0.0990 $0.1200
Unleaded B100 -$0.5000 -47.05 $0.1200 108.33
NON RESPONSIVE
b Unleaded NO BID NO BID $0.1215 0.1215 NO BID NO BID NO BID
a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.1550 0.0900 $0.3400
B100 -$0.7250 0.0900 -$0.6600
NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
FRANKLIN B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.1550 0.1100 $0.3400
B100 NON-RESPONSIVE -$0.5000 -2.25 0.1100 98.33 -$0.6600 140.00
NON RESPONSIVE DECLINED - NON RESPONSIVE
b Unleaded $0.0950 0.0950 $0.1755 0.1755 NO BID $0.3400 0.3400
a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.3267 $0.0740 $0.0700 $0.3850
B100 -$0.6208 -$0.7250 $0.0700 -$0.6150
NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
ST. CHARLES B20 - Winter NO BID NO BID
Diesel $0.3767 $0.0740 $0.0900 $0.3850
B100 -$0.6208 153.87 -$0.5500 -71.22 $0.0900 78.33 -$0.6150 185.00
b NON RESPONSIVE
Unleaded NO BID $0.3767 0.3767 $0.0935 0.0935 NO BID $0.3850 0.3850

BOLD Indicates low bid per item



