MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

MO DISTRICT 7
6-061011 BID TABULATION - FUEL DELIVERY
REX SMITH TRANPSORTATION MFA
ZONE ITEM # FUEL TYPE MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION #
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3540
B100 -$0.6460
BARRY B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3540
B100 -$0.6460 | 154.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3540 | 0.3540
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3440
B100 -$0.6560
BARTON B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3440
B100 -$0.6560 | 144.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3440 | 0.3440
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3850
B100 -$0.6150
BATES B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3850
B100 -$0.6150 185.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3850 | 0.3850
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3850
B100 -$0.6150
CEDAR B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3850
B100 -$0.6150 | 185.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3850 | 0.3850
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3440
B100 -$0.6560
DADE B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3440
B100 -$0.6560 | 144.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3440 | 0.3440
a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.1600 $0.3440
B100 -$0.8000 -$0.6560
NON RESPONSIVE
B20 - Winter
JASPER Diesel $0.1950 $0.3440
B100 -$0.8000 -20.33 -$0.6560 | 144.00
NON RESPONSIVE
b Unleaded $0.1600 0.1600 $0.3440 | 0.3440
Transport $0.1600 $0.2160




MISSOURI DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

MoSDOT DISTRICT 7
6-061011 BID TABULATION - FUEL DELIVERY
REX SMITH TRANPSORTATION MFA
ZONE ITEM # FUEL TYPE MARGIN EVALUATION # MARGIN EVALUATION #
a B20 - Summer
Diesel $0.1600 $0.3440
B100 -$0.8000 -$0.6560
DECLINED - NON RESPONSIVE
LAWRENCE B20 - Winter
Diesel $0.1950 $0.3440
B100 -$0.8000 -20.33 -$0.6560 | 144.00
NON RESPONSIVE
b Unleaded $0.1600 0.1600 $0.3440 | 0.3440
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3540
B100 -$0.6460
MCDONALD B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3540
B100 $0.6460 | 154.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3540 | 0.3540
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3540
B100 -$0.6460
NEWTON B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3540
B100 -$0.6460 | 154.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3540 | 0.3540
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3850
B100 -$0.6150
ST. CLAIR B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3850
B100 -$0.6150 | 185.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3850 | 0.3850
a Bio-Diesel
Diesel $0.3850
B100 -$0.6150
VERNON B20 - Winter NO BID
Diesel $0.3850
B100 -$0.6150 | 185.00
b Unleaded NO BID $0.3850 | 0.3850
BOLD | Indicates low bid per item




