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Kirk Juranus, District Engineer Toll free 1-888 ASK MoDOT Procurement Division

Thank you for your response to our Request for Informal Quotation # “D8PP-9034”. For your information, the following is a tabulation of all
responses which were received. If you have any questions, please contact me at the address/phone number shown below. Buyer; Richard Gardner,
Senior G.S. Technician.

WHITE CAP Ava Building Supply
Construction Supply
Product Description: Quikrete — Mix #1101 60 Ib. bag. — | Product Description: Quikrete — Mix #1101 60 Ib bag — 56 bag per
COUNTY | 56 bag per pallet — 16 pallet per truck load pallet — 14 pallet per truck load
Per Pallet Price Per Price Per Tractor Trailer Load | Per pallet Price Per Price Per Tractor Trailer Load
Price Pallet F.O.B Price Pallet F.O.B
Destination Destination

CHRISTIAN | $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid No-bid No-bid
DALLAS $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid No-bid No-bid
DOUGLAS $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid No-bid No-bid
GREENE $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid $190.40 $2665.60
HICKORY $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid No-bid No-bid
LACLEDE $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid No-bid No-bid
OZARK $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid $190.40 $2665.60
POLK $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid No-bid No-bid
STONE $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid No-bid No-bid
TANEY $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid No-bid No-bid
WEBSTER $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid $190.40 $2665.60
WRIGHT $193.78 $183.78 $3234.88 No-bid $190.40 $2665.60




LOWE’S #2314
Republic Missouri

Ash Grove — Materials and Packaging

Product Description: Quikrete — Mix #1101 60 Ib. bag. —

Product Description: Concrete Mix — 56 bags per pallet, 14

COUNTY | 56 bag per pallet — 16 pallet per truck load palletss per truck load
Per Pallet Price Per Price Per Tractor Trailer Load | Per pallet Price Per Price Per Tractor Trailer Load
Price Pallet F.0.B Price Pallet F.O.B
Destination Destination

CHRISTIAN | $168.88 $148.88 $2402.08 $159.84 $127.70 $2237.76
DALLAS No-bid No-bid No-bid $151.98 $127.70 $2127.72
DOUGLAS No-bid No-bid No-bid $166.98 $127.70 $2337.72
GREENE $168.88 $148.88 $2402.08 $151.98 $127.70 $2127.72
HICKORY No-bid No-bid No-bid $147.69 $127.70 $2067.66
LACLEDE No-bid No-bid No-bid $158.91 $127.70 $2224.74
OZARK No-bid No-bid No-bid $169.18 $127.70 $2368.52
POLK No-bid No-bid No-bid $148.44 $127.70 $2078.16
STONE No-bid No-bid No-bid $162.46 $127.70 $2274.44
TANEY No-bid No-bid No-bid $165.82 $127.70 $2321.48
WEBSTER No-bid No-bid No-bid $156.10 $127.70 $2185.40
WRIGHT No-bid No-bid No-bid $164.70 $127.70 $2305.80

ADDITIONAL NOTES:

Richard Gardner
Senior General Service Technician

Phone: 417-895-7811




