
Item # Estimated Tons Unit Cost Extended Total Unit Cost Extended Total Unit Cost Extended Total
1 1600 No Bid 40.30$           64,480.00$            41.55$           66,480.00$            
2 1400 15.00$           21,000.00$            No Bid No Bid
3 2800 No Bid 33.50$           93,800.00$            29.98$           83,944.00$            

Adjustment for Fuel

Item # Estimated Tons Unit Cost Extended Total Unit Cost Extended Total
1 1600 No Bid 42.00$           67,200.00$            
2 1400 14.99$           20,986.00$            No Bid
3 2800 No Bid 33.50$           93,800.00$            

Adjustment for Fuel

NO  NO  

District 8 Chip Seal Aggregate Tabulation
D8PP-9037

Option #1-Delivered Option #1-Delivered
Leo O'Laughlin, Inc.
Option #1-Delivered

Doss & Harper Stone Bobby Hoelscher Trucking

NO  

YES NO  

Option #1-Delivered
King Quarry, LLC Iron Mtn Trap Rock

Option #1-Delivered


