Winter Cold Patching Material Bid Tabulation/Info
Bid# D8X2-7018

Missouri Petroleum/UPM

Bulk Deliveries

County Cost/Ton
Christian 93.00
Dallas 96.00
Douglas 102.50
Greene 91.95
Hickory 99.25
Laclede 101.75
Ozark 102.30
Polk 93.30
Stone 97.00
Taney 96.65
Webster 94.50
Wright 103.00

Plant pick-up price at Willard, MO $89.00 per ton

Bagged Material
Bag size: 50 Ibs 56 bags/pallet

County Cost/Bag
Christian 10.56
Dallas 18.39
Douglas 9.81
Greene 19.73
Hickory 19.91
Laclede 17.95
Ozark 9.95
Polk 9.51
Stone 21.96
Taney 21.61
Webster 18.40

Wright 18.04



Logan County Asphalt(Pro-Line)

Bulk Deliveries

County Cost/Ton
Christian 98.00
Dallas 102.00
Douglas 100.00
Greene 103.00
Hickory 100.00
Laclede 100.00
Ozark 101.00
Polk 98.00
Stone 100.00
Taney 100.00
Webster 100.00
Wright 100.00

Note: All deliveries of bulk to be 25-ton minimum.

Bagged Material
Bag size: 50 Ibs 50 bags/pallet

County Cost/Bag
Christian 10.40
Dallas 10.40
Douglas 10.40
Greene 10.40
Hickory 10.40
Laclede 10.40
Ozark 10.40
Polk 10.40
Stone 10.40
Taney 10.40
Webster 10.40
Wright 10.40

Additional Info:
All deliveries to each county to be a minimum of (1) pallet (50 bags)

Also if we order (1) semi load of bags to one location, cost is $8.69/bag. A semi load is 1000 bags.



Carter Waters Construction Materials

Bulk Deliveries

Saturock Type F Saturock Plus w/ Fibers
County Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Christian 71.33 83.83
Dallas 69.89 82.39
Douglas 76.61 89.11
Greene 69.89 82.39
Hickory 65.57 78.07
Laclede 71.33 83.83
Ozark 78.53 91.03
Polk 67.49 79.99
Stone 74.69 87.19
Taney 75.17 87.67
Webster 74.21 86.71
Wright 75.65 88.15

Note: Prices are based on minimum truckload of 23 tons.

Bagged Material
Bag size: 60 Ibs 56 bags/pallet

County Cost/Bag
Christian no bid
Dallas no bid
Douglas no bid
Greene no bid
Hickory no bid
Laclede no bid
Ozark no bid
Polk no bid
Stone no bid
Taney no bid
Webster no bid

Wright no bid



	Missouri Petroleum/UPM
	County     Cost/Ton
	Bagged Material
	Bag size:  50 lbs 56 bags/pallet
	County     Cost/Bag
	 Logan County Asphalt(Pro-Line)
	County     Cost/Ton
	Bagged Material
	Bag size:  50 lbs 50 bags/pallet
	County     Cost/Bag
	 Carter Waters Construction Materials
	County   Cost/Ton    Cost/Ton
	Bagged Material
	Bag size:  60 lbs 56 bags/pallet
	County     Cost/Bag

