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Item # Description Est. Qty. Helena Chemical Townsend MFA
Total Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1 ESCORT XP 5,040 7.20$                   36,288.00$                   6.90$                   34,776.00$                   NO BID NO BID
8 or 16 ounce 

1A METSULFURON-METHYL 4,306 6.89$                   29,668.34$                   7.85$                   33,802.10$                   8.95$                   38,538.70$                   
8 or 16 ounce 

2 PLATEAU 954 277.00$               264,258.00$                 277.00$               264,258.00$                 NO BID NO BID
1 gallon 

3 PENDULUM AquaCap 472.5 40.25$                 19,018.13$                   36.50$                 17,246.25$                   NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 

4 OUST EXTRA 7,094 56.65$                 401,875.10$                 3.00$                   21,282.00$                   NO BID NO BID
64 ounce 

5 ROUNDUP PRO 500 37.00$                 18,500.00$                   35.60$                 17,800.00$                   NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 

5A GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 2,315 17.00$                 39,355.00$                   18.80$                 43,522.00$                   19.75$                 45,721.25$                   
Honcho Plus  - 2.5 gallon

6 ROUNDUP PRO 0 33.50$                 -$                              32.60$                 -$                              NO BID NO BID
30 gallon 

6A GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 960 16.80$                 16,128.00$                   18.30$                 17,568.00$                   18.35$                 17,616.00$                   
Honcho Plus  - 30 gallon

7 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2,495 29.00$                 72,355.00$                   31.20$                 77,844.00$                   NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 

8 MILESTONE VM 1,020 274.41$               279,898.20$                 254.50$               259,590.00$                 NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 

9 2.4-D ester 6,410 NO BID NO BID 13.70$                 87,817.00$                   NO BID NO BID
Riverdale 2,4-D L.V. 4  - 2.5 gallon 

10 GARLON 3A 985 60.29$                 59,385.65$                   61.10$                 60,183.50$                   NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 

10A TRICLOPYR 3,565 45.99$                 163,954.35$                 39.00$                 139,035.00$                 NO BID NO BID
Element 3A  - 2.5 gallon 

11 KRENITE S 1,560 45.42$                 70,855.20$                   50.40$                 78,624.00$                   NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 

12 PATHFINDER II 560 34.00$                 19,040.00$                   33.00$                 18,480.00$                   NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 

13 OUTRIDER 10,320 11.74$                 121,156.80$                 12.35$                 127,452.00$                 NO BID NO BID
20 ounce 

14 TRANSLINE 70 299.00$               20,930.00$                   299.80$               20,986.00$                   NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 

15 GLYPHOSATE 85 19.99$                 1,699.15$                     24.00$                 2,040.00$                     NO BID NO BID
Aqua Star  - 2.5 gallon 

16 DRIFT CONTROL 338 18.00$                 6,084.00$                     21.00$                 7,098.00$                     NO BID NO BID
Partition  - 1 gallon Per 100 gallons 6.75$                            Per 100 gallons 0.49$                            

17 NON-IONIC SURFACTANT 2,831 14.00$                 39,634.00$                   13.20$                 37,369.20$                   NO BID NO BID
Chaos  - 1 gallon 

18 WATERSOFT BY UAP 485 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 
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Item # Description Est. Qty. CWC Chemical Veg. Mgmt. Supply
Total Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1 ESCORT XP 5,040 7.68$                   38,707.20$                   7.30$                   36,792.00$                   
8 or 16 ounce 

1A METSULFURON-METHYL 4,306 8.45$                   36,385.70$                   5.45$                   23,467.70$                   
8 or 16 ounce 

2 PLATEAU 954 277.00$               264,258.00$                 277.00$               264,258.00$                 
1 gallon 

3 PENDULUM AquaCap 472.5 39.60$                 18,711.00$                   38.08$                 17,992.80$                   
2.5 gallon 

4 OUST EXTRA 7,094 3.78$                   26,815.32$                   3.96$                   28,092.24$                   
64 ounce 

5 ROUNDUP PRO 500 34.88$                 17,440.00$                   34.58$                 17,290.00$                   
2.5 gallon 

5A GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 2,315 19.32$                 44,725.80$                   19.98$                 46,253.70$                   
Honcho Plus  - 2.5 gallon

6 ROUNDUP PRO 0 35.50$                 -$                              33.18$                 -$                              
30 gallon 

6A GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 960 19.60$                 18,816.00$                   33.18$                 31,852.80$                   
Honcho Plus  - 30 gallon

7 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2,495 30.55$                 76,222.25$                   29.70$                 74,101.50$                   
2.5 gallon 

8 MILESTONE VM 1,020 279.95$               285,549.00$                 251.62$               256,652.40$                 
2.5 gallon 

9 2.4-D ester 6,410 15.35$                 98,393.50$                   15.38$                 98,585.80$                   
Riverdale 2,4-D L.V. 4  - 2.5 gallon 

10 GARLON 3A 985 65.80$                 64,813.00$                   55.72$                 54,884.20$                   
2.5 gallon 

10A TRICLOPYR 3,565 47.00$                 167,555.00$                 38.96$                 138,892.40$                 
Element 3A  - 2.5 gallon 

11 KRENITE S 1,560 52.00$                 81,120.00$                   48.95$                 76,362.00$                   
2.5 gallon 

12 PATHFINDER II 560 34.50$                 19,320.00$                   31.14$                 17,438.40$                   
2.5 gallon 

13 OUTRIDER 10,320 12.48$                 128,793.60$                 12.21$                 126,007.20$                 
20 ounce 

14 TRANSLINE 70 302.58$               21,180.60$                   299.63$               20,974.10$                   
2.5 gallon 

15 GLYPHOSATE 85 34.55$                 2,936.75$                     24.38$                 2,072.30$                     
Aqua Star  - 2.5 gallon 

16 DRIFT CONTROL 338 24.70$                 8,348.60$                     NO BID NO BID
Partition  - 1 gallon Per 100 gallons 0.58$                            

17 NON-IONIC SURFACTANT 2,831 15.22$                 43,087.82$                   NO BID NO BID
Chaos  - 1 gallon 

18 WATERSOFT BY UAP 485 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 
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Item # Description Est. Qty. UAP Distr. Alenza Scotwood Industries
Total Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1 ESCORT XP 5,040 7.75$                   39,060.00$                   7.75$                   39,060.00$                   NO BID NO BID 
8 or 16 ounce ALL ITEMS ALL ITEMS

1A METSULFURON-METHYL 4,306 7.75$                   33,371.50$                   7.49$                   32,251.94$                   
8 or 16 ounce 

2 PLATEAU 954 277.00$               264,258.00$                 277.00$               264,258.00$                 
1 gallon 

3 PENDULUM AquaCap 472.5 38.00$                 17,955.00$                   38.00$                 17,955.00$                   
2.5 gallon 

4 OUST EXTRA 7,094 4.84$                   34,334.96$                   5.61$                   39,797.34$                   
64 ounce 

5 ROUNDUP PRO 500 34.60$                 17,300.00$                   37.50$                 18,750.00$                   
2.5 gallon 

5A GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 2,315 24.25$                 56,138.75$                   17.49$                 40,489.35$                   
Honcho Plus  - 2.5 gallon

6 ROUNDUP PRO 0 NO BID NO BID 34.25$                 -$                              
30 gallon 

6A GLYPHOSATE WITH SURFACT. 960 23.75$                 22,800.00$                   16.90$                 16,224.00$                   
Honcho Plus  - 30 gallon

7 ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE 2,495 28.10$                 70,109.50$                   33.60$                 83,832.00$                   
2.5 gallon 

8 MILESTONE VM 1,020 271.30$               276,726.00$                 276.00$               281,520.00$                 
2.5 gallon 

9 2.4-D ester 6,410 14.75$                 94,547.50$                   13.50$                 86,535.00$                   
Riverdale 2,4-D L.V. 4  - 2.5 gallon 

10 GARLON 3A 985 65.45$                 64,468.25$                   60.01$                 59,109.85$                   
2.5 gallon 

10A TRICLOPYR 3,565 44.42$                 158,357.30$                 43.75$                 155,968.75$                 
Element 3A  - 2.5 gallon 

11 KRENITE S 1,560 49.35$                 76,986.00$                   43.99$                 68,624.40$                   
2.5 gallon 

12 PATHFINDER II 560 34.60$                 19,376.00$                   34.49$                 19,314.40$                   
2.5 gallon 

13 OUTRIDER 10,320 11.80$                 121,776.00$                 11.45$                 118,164.00$                 
20 ounce 

14 TRANSLINE 70 286.00$               20,020.00$                   294.02$               20,581.40$                   
2.5 gallon 

15 GLYPHOSATE 85 28.50$                 2,422.50$                     22.50$                 1,912.50$                     
Aqua Star  - 2.5 gallon 

16 DRIFT CONTROL 338 17.10$                 5,779.80$                     12.95$                 4,377.10$                     
Partition  - 1 gallon Per 100 gallons 0.13$                            

17 NON-IONIC SURFACTANT 2,831 12.20$                 34,538.20$                   11.85$                 33,547.35$                   
Chaos  - 1 gallon Per 100 gallons 0.76$                            

18 WATERSOFT BY UAP 485 16.00$                 7,760.00$                     NO BID NO BID
2.5 gallon 



Low Bid  

Non-responsible (Vendor did not submit MSDS/label or Certificate of Analysis)

Alenza won award for line item # 2 by drawing of lots.
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