
Carbide Tipped PNS TECH Valk Manufact. Jack's Municipal MidCorp
1 7600613442 – Carbide Tipped – ¾” thickness x 5” wide x 3’ length 168.10$               139.30$                165.89$                No Bid
2 7600613452 – Carbide Tipped – ¾” thickness x 5” wide x 4’ length 224.12$               185.76$                221.19$                No Bid
3 7600613462 – Carbide Tipped – ¾” thickness x 5” wide x 5’ length 280.15$               232.20$                276.49$                No Bid

4
7600613446 – Carbide Tipped – 7/8” thickness x 5” wide x 3’ length

175.09$               143.37$                168.92$                No Bid

5
7600613456 – Carbide Tipped – 7/8” thickness x 5” wide x 4’ length

233.44$               191.16$                225.23$                No Bid

6
7600613466 – Carbide Tipped – 7/8”thickness x 5” wide x 5’ length

291.80$               238.95$                281.54$                No Bid

Total: 1,372.70$            1,130.74$             1,339.26$              No Bid

Flat Steel PNS TECH Valk Manufact. Jack's Municipal MidCorp
1 7600670120 – Flat Steel – ½” thickness x 8” wide x 10’ length No Bid 108.00$                103.50$                No Bid
2 7600670121 – Flat Steel – ½” thickness x 8” wide x 11’ length No Bid 118.00$                112.85$                No Bid
3 7600670122 – Flat Steel – ½” thickness x 8” wide x 12’ length No Bid 129.00$                124.20$                No Bid
4 7600670124 – Flat Steel – ½” thickness x 8” wide x 14’ length No Bid 151.00$                144.90$                No Bid
5 7600670126 – Flat Steel – ½” thickness x 8” wide x 16’ length No Bid 172.00$                165.60$                No Bid

Total: No Bid 678.00$                651.05$                No Bid

VARIOUS SNOW PLOW, LOADER AND MAINTAINER BLADES - RFB 2-080408BT 



Maintainer and Loader PNS TECH Valk Manufact. Jack's Municipal MidCorp
1 7600610106 - Maintainer – ½” thickness x 8” wide x 6’ length No Bid 62.00$                  No Bid No Bid
2 7600610107 - Maintainer – ½” thickness x 8” wide x 7’ length No Bid 72.00$                  No Bid No Bid
3 7600610108 - Maintainer – ½” thickness x 8” wide x 8’ length No Bid 84.50$                  No Bid No Bid
4 7600610276 - Loader – 1” thickness x 10” wide x 7’6” length No Bid 550.00$                No Bid No Bid
5 7600610280 - Loader – 1” thickness x 10” wide x 8’ length No Bid 550.00$                No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid 1,318.50$             No Bid No Bid

Dual Carbide PNS TECH Valk Manufact. Jack's Municipal MidCorp
1 7600610145 – Dual Carbide – 3/4” thickness x 5” wide x 3’ length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 7600610149 - Dual Carbide – 3/4” thickness x 5” wide x 4’ length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 7600610161 - Dual Carbide – 3/4” thickness x 5” wide x 5’ length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 7600610147 – Dual Carbide – 7/8” thickness x 5” wide x 3’ length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 7600610159 - Dual Carbide – 7/8” thickness x 5” wide x 4’ length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 7600610163 - Dual Carbide – 7/8” thickness x 5” wide x 5’ length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



Special Hardened Maintainer PNS TECH Valk Manufact. Jack's Municipal MidCorp

20
7600610805 – Special Hardener Maintainer – 5/8” - 7/8” thickness x 
8” wide x 5’ length No Bid 94.00$                  139.35$                No Bid

21
7600610806 – Special Hardener Maintainer – 5/8” - 7/8” thickness x 
8” wide x 6’ length No Bid 112.00$                159.25$                No Bid

22
7600610807 – Special Hardener Maintainer – 5/8” - 7/8” thickness x 
8” wide x 7’ length No Bid 131.00$                179.10$                No Bid

23
7600610808 – Special Hardener Maintainer – 5/8” - 7/8” thickness x 
8” wide x 8’ length No Bid 150.00$                199.00$                No Bid

Total: No Bid 487.00$                676.70$                No Bid

Hardened Steel PNS TECH Valk Manufact. Jack's Municipal MidCorp
24 7600610185 – Hardened Steel – 1” thickness x 8” wide x 5’ length No Bid No Bid 222.30$                No Bid
25 7600610186 – Hardened Steel – 1” thickness x 8” wide x 6’ length No Bid No Bid 257.00$                No Bid

Total: No Bid No Bid 479.30$                No Bid

Rubber PNS TECH Valk Manufact. Jack's Municipal * MidCorp

26
7600612070 – Rubber Snow Blade – 1-1/2” thickness x 8” wide x 7’ 
length No Bid 168.00$                No Bid 245.00$               

27
7600612000 – Rubber Snow Blade – 1-1/2” thickness x 8” wide x 12’ 
length No Bid 288.00$                No Bid 420.00$               

Total: No Bid 456.00$                No Bid 665.00$               

Apparent low bidder

* MidCorp - Bidder submitted bid with alternate spec.


