RFB 5-081112FR — Concrete Reclamation Services
Bid Results — November 12, 2008

Cubic Unit Price Per | Unit Price Per
Slab Pile Locations - DISTRICT 1 vards ey Cy
Mid-Missouri Cecco, Inc.
Recycling
Andrew County, Savannah Maintenance
Lot, Bus. Route 71, 1 mile east of 1-29
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 400 $9.85 $48.00
Draynage Aggregate Crushed Quantity 200 $9.85 $52.00
Estimate
Andrew County, Route 71, 0.2 miles
south of Route 59
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 200 $9.85 $48.00
Drglnage Aggregate Crushed Quantity 200 $9.85 $52.00
Estimate
Atchison County, Tarkio Maintenance $
Lot, Route 136, 1 mile east of Tarkio
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate] 1000 $9.85 $48.00
DeKalb County, Route 36 westbound, 4.3
miles west of Route 69
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 700 $9.85 $48.00
Dra_mage Aggregate Crushed Quantity 500 $9.85 $52.00
Estimate
DeKalb County, Cameron Maintenance
Lot (Old Route 36, ¥ mile east of Route
69)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 400 $9.85 $48.00
Draynage Aggregate Crushed Quantity 300 $9.85 $52.00
Estimate
Extended Totals $38,415 $192,000
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Unit Price Unit Price Per
Slab Pile Locations - DISTRICT 2 Cubic Yards perCy cY
Mid-Missouri Cecco, Inc.
Recycling
Linn County, Brookfield
Maintenance Lot (Route 36 @
Route 11)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity 1,500 NO BID $41.00
Estimate ’ '
Drainage Aggregate Quantity 1500 NO BID $41.00
Estimate ’ '
Extended Totals NO BID $123,000
Unit Price Per | Unit Price Per
. . Cubic CY CY
Slab Pile Locations - DISTRICT 3 vards | Mid-Missouri Cecco, Inc.
Recycling
Monroe County, Paris Maintenance Lot @ (Bus
24, 1 Mile East of Route 24 Jct. W)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 270 $12.00 $67.00
Boone County, Centralia Maintenance Lot @
(Route 22/Route 151 Junction)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 400 $12.00 $67.00
Montgomery County, New Florence Maintenance
Lot @ (I-70 Outer Road, 0.6 Mile East of Route 19)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 2000 $12.00 $67.00
Warren County, Warrenton Maintenance Lot @
(Route MM, 0.3 Mile West of Route U)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 400 $12.00 $67.00
Shelby County, Shelbina Maintenance Lot @
(Route 36, 0.4 Mile West of Route 15)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 150 $12.00 $67.00
Clark County, Wayland Maintenance Lot @
(Route 27, 0.6 Mile South of Route 136)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 200 $12.00 $67.00
Extended Totals $41,040 $229,140
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Unit Price

Unit Price Per

- - Cubic Per CY CYy
Slab Pile Locations — DISTRICT 4 Yards |Mid-Missouri| Cecco, Inc.
Recycling
Lafayette County, Higginsville Maintenance Lot
@ (Route 13, 0.2 Mile South of Route 20)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 1000 $9.85 $29.00
Drainage Aggregate Quantity Estimate 1000 $9.85 $36.00
Extended Totals $19,700 $65,000
Unit Price Unit Price
Cubic Per CY Per CY
Slab Pile Locations — DISTRICT 6 Mid- Cecco, Inc.
Yards . .
Missouri
Recycling
St. Charles County, @ Intersection of Route K
and Route N
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 1400 $9.85 $29.00
St. Charles County, Wentzville Maintenance
Lot @ (1475 West Pearce Blvd.)
Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 300 $9.85 $105.00
Extended Totals $16,745 $72,100
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Unit Price

Unit Price Per

. . Cubic Per CY CY
Slab Pile Locations - DISTRICT 7 vards |Mid-Missouri| Cecco, Inc.

Recycling

Bates County, Route 18 Mixing Board @ 9 miles

East of Route 71 (North of Route 18)

Drainage Aggregate Quantity Estimate 250 $9.85 $37.00

Bates County, Route A Mixing Board @ 6 miles

West of Route 71 (South of Route A)

Drainage Aggregate Quantity Estimate 225 $9.85 $37.00

Barry County, Cassville Maintenance Lot @

(Route 37, 1.8 Mile South of Routes 76 & 86)

Drainage Aggregate Quantity Estimate 400 $9.85 $37.00

Barry County, Verona Storage Area @ Junction

of Route 60 & Business Route 60

Drainage Aggregate Quantity Estimate 275 $9.85 $37.00

Vernon County, Sheldon Maintenance Lot @

(Route B, 0.2 Miles East of Route 71)

Drainage Aggregate Quantity Estimate 190 $9.85 $37.00

Extended Totals $13,199 $49,580
Unit Price | Unit Price Per
- - Cubic Per CY CcY
Slab Pile Locations - DISTRICT 10 Yards |Mid-Missouri| Cecco, Inc.

Recycling

Pemiscot County, Route J @ (South City Limits

of Hayti)

Rock Ditch Liner Crushed Quantity Estimate 2000 $9.85 $49.00

Extended Totals $19,700 $98,000

AWARD:

Award to low, responsive bidder, Mid Missouri Recycling: Districts 1, 3, 4, 6, 7, and 10.

MoDOQOT is not awarding District 2.

RFB 5-081112FR - Concrete Reclamation Services
Bid Results — November 12, 2008

Page 4 of 4




	NO BID
	NO BID
	Extended Totals
	Extended Totals
	Extended Totals
	Extended Totals


