
Item #1, Four Wheel (Vacuum) or Regenerative Air Street Sweeper

Coop. MSRP

Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 ARO Yes/No Discount

Schwarze Industries, Inc. Schwarze A7000 $209,194.71 ($3,765.00) NA 90 - 120 days Yes 3%

Schwarze A8000 $253,920.49 ($3,765.00) NA 90 - 120 days Yes 3%

Schwarze A9000 $221,306.13 ($3,765.00) NA 90 - 120 days Yes 3%

Schwarze A4000 $136,197.22 ($3,765.00) NA 60 - 90 days Yes 3%

Schwarze GS6 $204,538.22 ($3,765.00) NA 90 - 120 days Yes 3%

Tymco Tymco 600BAH $200,136.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Tymco 600BAH $216,695.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Tymco DST-6 $280,844.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Tymco 600-HSP $213,977.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Tymco 500x $221,296.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Tymco 435 $141,534.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Tymco 435 $162,887.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90 - 150 days Yes 0%

Tymco 210 $120,989.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Tymco 210 $101,689.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Key Equipment Elgin Crosswind $218,495.00 ($1,850.00) NA 90 days Yes 0%

Elgin Whirlwind MV $251,335.00 ($1,850.00) NA 90 days Yes 0%

Global Environmental Products No Bid

Item #2, Mechanical Broom with Vacuum-Assist Filtration Street Sweeper

Coop. MSRP

Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 ARO Yes/No Discount

Schwarze Industries, Inc. No Bid

Tymco No Bid

Key Equipment Elgin Eagle Waterless $310,895.00 ($1,850.00) NA 90 days Yes 0%

Global Environmental Products No Bid
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Item #3, Mechanical Street Sweeper, minimum 3.5 to 4 cubic yards

Coop. MSRP

Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 Option 2 ARO Yes/No Discount

Schwarze Industries, Inc. No Bid

Tymco No Bid

Key Equipment Elgin Pelican $178,895 (74 HP Tier 4) ($350.00) NA NA 60 to 90 days Yes 0%

Global Environmental Products Global M3 $162,300.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 90 - 120 days Yes 2%

Global MX3 $172,490.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 90 - 120 days Yes 2%

Item #4, Four Wheel Mechanical Street Sweeper

Coop. MSRP

Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 Option 2 ARO Yes/No Discount

Schwarze Industries, Inc. Schwarze M6000 SE $248,063.14 ($3,765.00) N/A NA 90 - 180 days Yes 3%

Schwarze M6000 TE $204,538.22 ($3,765.00) 90 - 180 days Yes

Tymco No Bid

Key Equipment Elgin Eagle $256,495.00 ($1,850.00) NA Included 90 days Yes 0%

Global Environmental Products Global M4 $226,815.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 90 - 120 days Yes 2%

Global Python S2000 $169,980.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 120 days Yes 2%

Global Python S2500 $223,425.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 120 days Yes 2%
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Name: Schwarze Industries, Inc.

Contact name: Joseph Hendrickson

Address Line: 1055 Jordan Road

Address Line: Huntsville, AL  35811

Telephone #: 800-879-7933, Ext. 1150

Email: jhendrickson@schwarze.com

Vendor # 630727445

Cooperative: Yes

Name: Tymco

Contact name: Bobby Johnson

Address Line: 225 E. Industrial Blvd.

Address Line: Waco, TX  76705

Telephone #: 800-258-9626

Email: tymcosales@tymco.com

Vendor # 741693738

Cooperative: Yes

Name: Key Equipment and Supply

Contact name: Steve Hyink

Address Line: 13507 Northwest Industrial Dr.

Address Line: Bridgeton, MO

Telephone #: (800) 325-4323

Email: Steve@KeyEquipment.com

Vendor # 4307892280

Cooperative: Yes

Name: Global Environmental Products

Contact name: Chad Bormann

Address Line: 4985 Hallmark Pkwy.

Address Line: San Bernardino, CA  92407

Telephone #: 909-713-1600

Email: info@globalsweeper.com

Vendor # 450647559

Cooperative: Yes
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Option Description

1 Cab Raise Assist Jack
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