
Item #1, Four Wheel (Vacuum) or Regenerative Air Street Sweeper

Coop. MSRP
Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 ARO Yes/No Discount

Schwarze Industries, Inc. Schwarze A7000 $215,470.54 ($3,765.00) NA 90 - 120 days Yes 3%
Schwarze A8000 $261,538.09 ($3,765.00) NA 90 - 120 days Yes 3%
Schwarze A9000 $227,945.30 ($3,765.00) NA 90 - 120 days Yes 3%
Schwarze A4000 $140,283.13 ($3,765.00) NA 60 - 90 days Yes 3%
Schwarze GS6 $210,674.36 ($3,765.00) NA 90 - 120 days Yes 3%

Tymco Tymco 600BAH $204,138.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%
Tymco 600BAH $221,028.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%
Tymco DST-6 $286,460.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Tymco 600-HSP $218,256.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%
Tymco 500x $225,721.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%
Tymco 435 $144,364.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%
Tymco 435 $166,144.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90 - 150 days Yes 0%
Tymco 210 $123,408.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%
Tymco 210 $103,722.00 ($2,000.00) NA 90-150 days Yes 0%

Key Equipment Elgin Crosswind $229,925.00 ($1,850.00) NA 90 days Yes 0%
Elgin Whirlwind MV $263,150.00 ($1,850.00) NA 90 days Yes 0%

Global Environmental Products No Bid

Item #2, Mechanical Broom with Vacuum-Assist Filtration Street Sweeper

Coop. MSRP
Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 ARO Yes/No Discount

Schwarze Industries, Inc. No Bid

Tymco No Bid

Key Equipment Elgin Eagle Waterless $310,895.00 ($1,850.00) NA 90 days Yes 0%

Global Environmental Products No Bid
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Item #3, Mechanical Street Sweeper, minimum 3.5 to 4 cubic yards

Coop. MSRP
Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 Option 2 ARO Yes/No Discount

Schwarze Industries, Inc. No Bid

Tymco No Bid

Key Equipment Elgin Pelican $186,765.00 (74 HP Tier 4) ($350.00) NA NA 60 to 90 days Yes 0%

Global Environmental Products Global M3 $168,600.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 90 - 120 days Yes 2%
Global MX3 $179,230.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 90 - 120 days Yes 2%

Item #4, Four Wheel Mechanical Street Sweeper
Coop. MSRP

Vendor Make/Model Base Price White Paint Option 1 Option 2 ARO Yes/No Discount

Schwarze Industries, Inc. Schwarze M6000 SE $254,733.85 ($3,765.00) N/A NA 90 - 180 days Yes 3%
Schwarze M6000 TE $255,505.02 ($3,765.00) 90 - 180 days Yes

Tymco No Bid

Key Equipment Elgin Eagle $264,400.00 ($1,850.00) NA Included 90 days Yes 0%

Global Environmental Products Global M4 $234,640.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 90 - 120 days Yes 2%
Global Python S2000 $178,980.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 120 days Yes 2%

Global Python S2500 $233,425.00 ($1,200.00) NA NA 120 days Yes 2%
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Name: Schwarze Industries, Inc.
Contact name: Joseph Hendrickson
Address Line: 1055 Jordan Road
Address Line: Huntsville, AL  35811
Telephone #: 800-879-7933, Ext. 1150
Email: jhendrickson@schwarze.com
Vendor # 630727445
Cooperative: Yes

Name: Tymco
Contact name: Bobby Johnson
Address Line: 225 E. Industrial Blvd.
Address Line: Waco, TX  76705
Telephone #: 800-258-9626
Email: tymcosales@tymco.com
Vendor # 741693738
Cooperative: Yes

Name: Key Equipment and Supply
Contact name: Steve Hyink
Address Line: 13507 Northwest Industrial Dr.
Address Line: Bridgeton, MO
Telephone #: (800) 325-4323
Email: Steve@KeyEquipment.com
Vendor # 4307892280
Cooperative: Yes

Name: Global Environmental Products
Contact name: Chad Bormann
Address Line: 4985 Hallmark Pkwy.
Address Line: San Bernardino, CA  92407
Telephone #: 909-713-1600
Email: info@globalsweeper.com
Vendor # 450647559
Cooperative: Yes

VENDOR INFORMATION

Missouri Department of Transportation
Bid Tabulation of Request 3-120223RJ  Street Sweepers

Multiple Award (Prices good through February 15, 2015)

Page 1 of 1



Option Description
1 Cab Raise Assist Jack
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